
Quality Life through Good Roads “We Care” 

Inter–Departmental Memorandum 
CENTRAL OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT

DATE: March 4, 2026 

TO: Gary Piotrowicz, P.E., PTOE, Deputy Managing Director 

FROM: Mary N. Gillis, P.E., Director, Central Operations Department 

SUBJECT: FY 2026 DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS – IFB NO.7732 

Background: 

The RCOC utilizes Disposable Paper Products agency-wide for office use and janitorial 
mechanic clean up.  

Financial Considerations: 

A solicitation was issued through the MiTN (Michigan Inter-Governmental Trade 
Network). Forty-eight (48) vendors downloaded bid documents, and twenty-one (21) 
suppliers submitted responses. Of those responses, seven (7) suppliers met the minimum 
order requirements. 

It is recommended that contracts be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible 
suppliers meeting specifications, offering firm-fixed annual pricing, and maintaining low 
minimum order requirements, as summarized below: 

  Staples Contract & Commercial LLC 
 4 items (see tabulations) 
 Annual Estimated Total: $20,028.00 
 Pricing: One-year firm-fixed 
 Minimum Order: $50 
 Delivery: 3–5 days 

  Armorex (formerly Tri-County Supply) 
 1 item (see tabulations) 
 One-time purchase 
 Total: $1,435.00 

Recommendation: 

I recommend that the Board approve contracts with Staples Contract & Commercial LLC 
in the amount of $20,028.00 and Armorex in the amount of $1,435.00, for a total annual 
estimated contract amount of $21,463.00. 
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Quality Life through Good Roads “We Care” 
 
 
 
 

Inter–Departmental Memorandum 
INVENTORY CONTROL 

 
 DATE: March 4, 2026 
 
TO: Mary N. Gillis, P.E., Director of Central Operations 
  
FROM: Lori A. Doran, Manager, Inventory Control 
  
SUBJECT: DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS -  IFB NO. 7732 
216 suppliers were notified of the above-listed solicitation. 48 solicitation documents were 
downloaded from the MiTN (Michigan Inter-Governmental Trade Network) site. 21 suppliers 
responded.  
 
Of the 21 responses, ten suppliers offered firm-fixed annual term pricing. Of those ten 
responses, seven suppliers required minimum order requirements. 
 
It is recommended the contract be awarded to the overall low suppliers meeting specifications, 
offering firm-fixed annual pricing, and low minimum order requirements: 
 
             Annual Estimated Total  
Staples Contract & Commercial LLS 4 items; see tabulations  $20,028.00 

Pricing: 1 year firm-fixed   
Minimum Order: $50 
Delivery: 3-5 days 

 
Armorex, formerly Tri-County Supply 1 item; see tabulations  $1,435.00 
      Single, 1-time purchase order 
      Delivery: 1 day 
 

RCOC Item Number and Description 
2025 2026 

 +/- cost 
difference 

1000611 
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS $1.56 $4.42 183.333% 

1001502 
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION $1.41 $0.71 -49.645% 



 
 
 
 

1001552 
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS $1.76 $1.37 -22.159% 

1001601 
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

No 
Solicitation $15.95 N/A 

94576 
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270 

No 
Solicitation $1.70 N/A 

 
 
It is recommended that the Disposable Paper Products contract be awarded to Staples Contract 
& Commercial LLC for $20,028 and Armorex, formerly Tri-County Supply for $1,435.00; for a 
total annual estimated contract amount of $21,463.00. 
 
Cc: File 



Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITIES
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          0.80             5,632.00 

Please order in 
case quantities 
of 80 rolls per 
case  No Bid  No Bid 

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

 No Bid  No Bid Marcal NP-5301          1.69     15,210.00 

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

Kimberly Clark 21270          1.25                 360.00 

Please order in 
case quantities 
of 36 boxes per 
case Marcal NP-5701          0.98            282.24 3rd low - DNMS

TOTALS:

Broner Glove & Safety
1750 Harmon Rd

Auburn Hills, Michigan, 48326

5,992.00$                        

NO

Until 6/30/2026 - price will only increase if manufacturer raises prices
$500 
4-Jan
NO

YES

Continental Linen Services
4200 Manchester Road

Kalamazoo, Michigan, 40001

15,492.24$                  

NO

1 year (FIRM)
$100 
5 days
NO

YES

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

IFB NO.7732 AEQ_02.10.2026.xlsx
Page 1 of 11



Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 
KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          0.86             6,054.40 

EMPRESS HT 400021          1.71          15,390.00 

MINIMUM 
ORDER 140 
CASES Santoray 0430H          1.14          10,260.00 

JEM 
INDUSTRIES, 
INC 5100-25       16.25             1,462.50 

MINIMUM 
ORDER 24/25# 
CASES

International 
Wiper 25LBP       25.00             2,250.00 

SOLARIS SOL 11516          0.94                 270.72 

MINIMUM 
ORDER 48 
CASES Santoray 4211C          0.61                 175.68 low, DNMS

18,740.08$                      

United Sales Usa Corp
185 30th Street

Brooklyn, New York, 11232

JEM Industries Inc.
25600 Dequindre Road

Warren, Michigan, 48091

NO

SUBJECT TO MANUFACTURER INCREASES
#3-140 CASES, #4-24 CASES, #5-48 CASES
3-5 BUSINESS DAYS ARO

17,123.22$                      

NO

YES YES
NO

12 months (FIRM)
N/A
1-10 days
NO

IFB NO.7732 AEQ_02.10.2026.xlsx
Page 2 of 11



Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

 No Bid  No Bid 

DIXIE 
PERFECT 
TOUCH DXE 5338CD  $     5.69  $        2,845.00 

 No Bid  No Bid 
KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          0.70             4,928.00 

Marcal MFN4000          2.13          19,170.00 Reliable 1.0741665E7          1.21          10,890.00 

9000 packs 
does not 
come out 
evenly with 

 No Bid  No Bid 1.0833025E7       23.17             2,085.30 

 No Bid  No Bid Reliable 2.0037327E7          0.81                 233.28 

Central Poly-Bag Corp.
2400 BEDLE PLACE

Linden, New Jersey, 07036

19,170.00$                      

YES
Item 3: 9.25"; Marcal #MFN-4000
One year (FIRM)

YES

20,981.58$                      

Audio Visual Equipment & Supplies, Inc.
21327 Hilltop Street

Southfield, Michigan, 48033

Per pallet
14-21 days
NO

NO
(Item #3 does not divide evenly into 9000 + it comes out to 562.5 
30 days from supplier

3-5 ARO
NO

YES

IFB NO.7732 AEQ_02.10.2026.xlsx
Page 3 of 11



Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor Comment

DIXIE PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $     5.66  $        2,830.00 

DIXIE 
PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $     2.22  $        1,110.00 Dixie

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          0.77             5,420.80 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          0.69             4,857.60 

Kimberly Clark - 
Surpass

Marcal
NP-
MFN4000          1.08             9,720.00 Retain 21280          1.62          14,580.00 9.2" X 9.4"

Anchor 40-3000       47.44             4,269.60 Anchor 20-2002       20.80             1,872.00 

Kimberly-Clark KC21270          1.63                 469.44 
Kimberly 
Clark 21270          1.37                 394.56 

APAC PAPER & PACKAGING CORP.
4000 Enterprise Drive

Allen Park, Michigan, 48101

22,814.16$                      

Lower Huron Chemical & Supply Co Inc.
5595 Treadwell Street

Wayne, Michigan, 48184

22,709.84$                      

NO

12 months  (FIRM)
$250 or $12.50 shipping charge for less
3-Feb
NO

YES
NO

One year firm with a 30 day increase letter
$300 
1 day ARO
NO

YES

IFB NO.7732 AEQ_02.10.2026.xlsx
Page 4 of 11



Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

DIXIE PERFECT 
TOUCH DXE 5338CD  $     5.49  $        2,745.00 

DIXIE 
PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $     4.89  $        2,445.00 

Sold and 
invoiced by the 
carton. Must 
order in 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          0.98             6,899.20 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          1.14             8,025.60 

Sold and 
invoiced by the 
carton. Must 
order in 

Genuine Joe GJO21040          1.36          12,240.00 Genuine Joe 21040          1.40          12,600.00 

Sold and 
invoiced by the 
carton. Must 
order in 

Office Snax OFX00070       13.99             1,259.10 
1 pound bag - 
low, DNMS

Anchor 
Wiping Cloth 460179       26.70             2,403.00 

Genuine Joe GJO26100          0.64                 184.32 2nd low, DNMS Daisy 444530          0.88                 253.44 

Sold and 
invoiced by the 
carton. Must 
order in 
increments of 
36 boxes.  You 

ARROW OFFICE SUPPLY CO.
17005 GRAND RIVER

DETROIT, Michigan, 48227

23,327.62$                      25,727.04$                      

OFFICE EXPRESS
1280 E Big Beaver Rd

Troy, Michigan, 48083-1946

YES

2-Jan
NO

YES
Multi fold towel is 9.25 x 9.40 (Genuine Joe)
1 yr as long as mfr holds their prices steady
Case quantities only. You will be invoiced by the case.
Varies by item. Generally 1-7 business days
NO

YES
NO

1 year (FIRM)
NO

IFB NO.7732 AEQ_02.10.2026.xlsx
Page 5 of 11



Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor Comment

DIXIE 
PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $     4.42  $        2,210.00 

Priced per 
tube, must 
order 20/CT

DIXIE PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $     5.11  $        2,555.00 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          0.71             4,998.40 

Priced per EA, 
must order 
80/CT

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          1.01             7,110.40 

Baseline BL55559          1.37          12,330.00 

Priced per 
Pack, must 
order 16/CT Power Brand 13401          1.40          12,600.00 

Hospeco
HOS5372
5       71.19             6,407.10 Anchor Wiping 14565       51.88             4,669.20 

Kimberly 
Clark 21271          1.70                 489.60 

Priced per BX, 
must order 
36/CT Kimberly Clark 13501          2.20                 633.60 

26,435.10$                      27,568.20$                      

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC
500 Staples Dr

Framingham, Massachusetts, 01702

SupplyDen Inc.
1026 Doris Rd

Auburn Hills, Michigan, 483

NO

1 Year (FIRM)
$50 minimum order
3-5 Days

YES YES
NO

1 year (FIRM)

Next day
NO

$150 min

NO

IFB NO.7732 AEQ_02.10.2026.xlsx
Page 6 of 11



Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor Comment

DIXIE 
PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $     5.75  $        2,875.00 

**50/TUBE...
MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 500 
TUBES**

DIXIE PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $     7.04  $        3,520.00 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          1.09             7,673.60 

**PRICE PER 
ROLL...MINIM
UM ORDER IS 
7040 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          1.23             8,659.20 

BOARDWALK
BWK620
2          1.44          12,960.00 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 
8992 
PACKS** GENUINE JOE

GJO2104
0          1.53          13,770.00 

HOSPECO 537-25       60.38             5,434.20 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 90 
BOXES** Hospeco

HOS5372
5       68.10             6,129.00 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 21270          2.25                 648.00 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 288 
BOXES** Kimberly-Clark

KCC2132
0          1.87                 538.56 

29,590.80$                      32,616.76$                      

Pyramid School Products
6510 N. 54th St.

Tampa, Florida, 33610

Supplies
7755 22 Mile Rd #182474

Shelby Twp, Michigan, 48316

2 to 3 days after receipt of order
NO

YES

1-year, unless price increases due to economic factors
$1,800 MOQ

YES
* Please note the order requirements listred with the bid items 

14-21 days
NO

YES
NO

6 month
Original bid quantities

IFB NO.7732 AEQ_02.10.2026.xlsx
Page 7 of 11



Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

DIXIE PERFECT 
TOUCH DXE 5338CD  $     7.19  $        3,595.00 

* Price quoted 
for 50/Sleeve. 
Sold as  
50/Sleeve, 20 

DIXIE 
PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $  7.13  $        3,565.00 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460          1.39             9,785.60 

* Price quoted 
for 550 
Sheets/roll. 
Sold as 550 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 4460       1.53          10,771.20 

Tork ESS MK520A          2.00          18,000.00 

Size:  9.5  x 
9.1" 
* Price quoted 
for 250/Pack. EMPRESS

DN 
281517B       6.71          60,390.00 

Hospeco N-W69-25    142.47          12,822.30 
ABSORBENTS 
MIDWEST 30-450-B    55.64             5,007.60 

Kleenex
KCC21270C
T          3.00                 864.00 

* Price quoted 
for 90/Box. 
Sold as 90/Box, 
36 Box/Case

KIMBERLY-
CLARK 21270       2.44                 702.72 

Agni Enterprises, LLC (dba) Head to Heels 
Safety Supplies

9021 SW 94th Street, Unit 510

45,066.90$                      

DEE DAVIS INC.
755 W. BIG BEAVER RD STE 2020

TROY, Michigan, 48084

80,436.52$                   

terms of contract (FIRM)

YES

2% Net 5 Days

NO

6 month (180 days)
Minimum order 1 Case / Minimum purchase order $250.00
7-14 Business Days

2% 10 NET 30

YES

YES

N/A
5-7 business days
YES
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Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

DIXIE PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $  81.00  $     40,500.00 

Price per box 
of 1,000 
cups is 
$81.00  No Bid  No Bid 

KIMBERLY CLARK 4460          0.92             6,476.80 

Must be 
ordered in 
cases of 80 
rolls. Each  No Bid  No Bid 

Fastenal 
Exclusive Brand

665097-
131448          4.04          36,360.00 

Price per 
pack is 
$4.04. Must 
be ordered in Lavex 500MFTN       20.00       180,000.00 

Fastenal 
Exclusive Brand 0614186       22.25             2,002.50 

Rags are 
cotton, but 
vendor 
cannot Hospeco

328HOS5
3725       79.00             7,110.00 

Fastenal 
Exclusive Brand 0601845          1.08                 311.04 

Must be 
ordered in 
quantities of 
30. Choice

5002FCC
UBE       25.00             7,200.00 

194,310.00$                   

Fastenal Company
50160 Pontiac Trail Unit 3
Wixom, Michigan, 48393

85,650.34$                      

11400 LLC - Direct Sales
2551 HORSESHOE RD

Lancaster, Pennsylvania, 17601

NO

1 year (FIRM)
$200 
3-5 Days
NO

YES

NO

YES
NO

6-12 months
Case quantity, if required
3-5 days
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Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor 
Comment

 No Bid  No Bid 
DIXIE PERFECT 
TOUCH

DXE 
5338CD  $  44.71  $     22,355.00 

 No Bid  No Bid KIMBERLY CLARK 4460       62.71       441,478.40 

CASCADES H175       23.74       213,660.00 

H175 SELECT 
MULTIFOLD 
KRAFT 
TOWELS - Durables 1313DBR       26.71       240,390.00 

SALTEX       15.95             1,435.50 

COLOURED 
COTTON T-
SHIRT 
WIPERS - Durables

22424FF
DB       44.71             4,023.90 

CASCADES F950       24.46             7,044.48 

F950 SELECT 
FLAT BOX 
2PLY FACIAL 
TISSUE - 
100sht, 30 
Boxes / Case Durables FF4144       62.71          18,060.48 

Armorex formerly Tri-County Supply
7109 Dan McGuire Drive

Brighton, Michigan, 48116

222,139.98$                   

Malor & Company Inc
3 Columbus Circle, 15 Floor

New York, NY, New York, 10019

726,307.78$                   

NO

NO

YES

YES

YES
NO

February 2026 until January 31, 2027 (FIRM)

Following Business day (see attachment)
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Road Commission for Oakland County

7732 - DISPOSABLE PAPER PRODUCTS, ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUA
February 10, 2026 / 2:30 PM

Description Quantity UOM

1000611
HOT/COLD INSULATED PAPER CUPS, 20 TB/BX8 OZ, DIXIE 
PERFECT TOUCH DXE 5338CD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS

500 Tube

1001502
TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY, 80 EA/BX, KIMBERLY CLARK 4460, 80  
RL/CASE  550 SHEET/RL 5512 SQFT/RL  NO SUBSTITUTION

7040 Each

1001552
MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWEL, NATURAL, RECYCLED 
250/PK,16PK/CS, 12.4"x9.4" GENUINE JOE OR EMPRESS

9000 Pack

1001601
CLOTH RAGS TOWEL FABRIC, 100%COTTON ONLY, 25LB BX +/-,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

90 Box

94576
FACIAL TISSUE, 8.4"X8.2", 2 PLY, BOX 4 3/8X4 1/2X5", 90 
SHEETS/BX, 36 BX/CS, KIMBERLY CLARK 21270

288 Box

TOTALS:

Specify:
How long do you anticipate your ability to hold pricing?
Minimum order requirements
Indicate number of days for delivery to RCOC after receipt of order:
Do you offer payment discounts? For example, 2% 10 Net 30
If so, state discount

Bid Solicitation Doc(s) Returned / Uploaded��
Is there an objection or deviation?

Manufacturer Part # Price Total Cost Vendor Comment

DIXIE PERFECT 
TOUCH DXE 5338CD  $  115.53  $     57,765.00 

KIMBERLY CLARK 4460         70.88       498,995.20 

Empress HT40021         38.55       346,950.00 

Kimberly Clark 21270         98.96          28,500.48 

Always Available Wholesales & Supply Services Corp
3010 University Dr NW

HUNTSVILLE, Alabama, 35810

932,210.68$                     

NO

14
NO

YES
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