
BOARD ACTION TAKEN, THURSDAY, JANUARY 28, 2010 
 
 
MOVED BY JAMIAN;  SUPPORTED BY WILSON: 
 
 THAT bids were advertised for, opened and read on Thursday, September 3, 2009 for Disposable Paper Products; 
IFB No. 7962-OQ; Annual Estimated Quantities.  A complete tabulation of bids typed on Thursday, September 3, 2009 
shall remain on file in the Clerks Office of the Road Commission; a summary of vendors submitting bids is as follows: 
 
            OPTIONAL  OPTIONAL 
         YEAR ONE  YEAR TWO  YEAR THREE 
      ADDITIONS/  TOTAL NET  TOTAL NET  TOTAL NET 

VENDOR    DEVIATIONS BID PRICE  BID PRICE  BID PRICE 
 Source Hub LLC   Meets Specs  $16,888.97  $17,688.30  No Bid 
 24151 Telegraph Road  (Low Bid Award $  2,128.00 
 Suite 120    on 1 Item) 
 Southfield, MI  48033 
 Terms:  Net 30 Days 
 FOB:  Destination 
 
 HP Products Corporation  Meets Specs  $17,397.44  No Bid  No Bid 
 8625 Haggerty Road,   (Low Bid Award $  7,590.80 

Suite 200    on 3 Items) 
Belleville, MI  48111 
Terms:  Net 30 Days 
FOB:  Destination 

 
 Office Max    Meets Specs  $31,082.50  No Bid  No Bid 
 13301 Stephens Road    (Low Bid Award $11,281.10 
 Warren, MI  48098   on 2 Items) 
 Terms:  Net 30 Days 
 FOB:  Destination 
 



 Bostwick – Braun   Meets Specs  $36,306.88  No Bid  No Bid 
 Toledo, OH  43604 
 
 HP Products Corporation  Does Not   $16,833.94  No Bid  No Bid 
 Belleville, MI  48111   Meet Specs 
      (Alternate Bid) 
 
 MSC Industrial Supply  Does Not  $28,260.83  $28,260.83  $28,260.83 
 Livonia, MI  48150   Meet Specs 
 
 THE Board accept and award the split bid to the low bidders meeting specifications from Source Hub LLC, 
Southfield, MI, with a total bid award of $2,128.00; HP Products Corporation, Belleville, MI; with a total bid award of 
$7,590.80; Office Max, Warren, MI, with a total bid award of $11,281.10; for a total net bid price of $20,999.90; with terms 
of net 30 days; and the Board authorize the Managing Director to act on behalf of the Board. 
 
 MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 
 
 




