
ROAD COMMISSION FOR OAKLAND COUNTY - Beverly Hills, Michigan

RCOC UNIT EXTENDED BRAND NAME UNIT EXTENDED
STOCK NO. DESCRIPTION 1 QTY UofM PRICE AMOUNT & NUMBER PRICE AMOUNT

4400024
GREASABLE FLANGE BEARING
SB206-20 JZ LF206
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 7 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4400107
1" AUGER BEARING
SB205 16G/FL 2 BOLT FLANGE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4400404 SPINNER HUB
SWENSON 0601200100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 15 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4401022 AUGER WELDMENT
SWENSON 0010696200
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4401056 INSERT(SWENSON TAILGATE SPRDR)
SWENSON 0010632100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4403036

PROPORTIONAL SOLENOID
REXROTH HYDRAULICS 578537
FT WE2 KC30/100AG12C2V
(BY-PASS REQUIRED) NO 
SUBSTITUTION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4403044 
CABLE ASSEMBLY
COMPUSPREAD 107564
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4404000
HYDRAULIC AUGER MOTOR 6 CU IN
W/4 PIN CONNECT WHITE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA NO BID NO BID

 White
RS06022102 417.50                4,175.00               

4404068
SPINNER MOTOR 3 CU IN
SWENSON 1011001009
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 35 EA NO BID NO BID SAM BH050 131.00                4,585.00               

4405016
D.A. ELECTRIC SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC118887
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4405024
SPINNER SECTION
REXROTH 1602052906 26D422
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4405032
AUGER SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC016563
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4405040 UNLOADER INLET BASIC 190156
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4406006

SPINNER DISC POLYURETHANE
SWENSON 04622 002 00
17-3/4 DIAMETER - COUNTER 
CLOCKWISE
ROTATION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

93489
M5966 AUGER, 1 WAY, DD GEARBOX
MONROE 00021636
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

93491

M5966 AUGER BUSHING 
UHMWMONROE 04041325
2-15/32" O.D x 1-9/32" I.D. x 4"
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

93508
CLAMP STYLE 50 PULSE SENSOR
FORCE AMERICA 200018097
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA NO BID NO BID

White
200018097 104.00                312.00                  

93717
GEAR BOX SANDER
SUPERIOR F0065 MONROE05007338
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

94038
MOTOR HYD 3.0 CU IN
VIKING CIVES 0550278
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA 250.00                  2,500.00               SAM BH050 131.00                1,310.00               

94039
SPINNER DISC PLY 22" STRT FLTS
VIKING CIVES 0710038
BRAND NAME / NUMBER5 5 EA 157.00                  785.00                  NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL: 3,285.00$            TOTAL: 10,382.00$          

Vendor Total: N/A Vendor Total: 9,727.00$            

Delivery Charge of $25

Vendor 2

Plymouth, MI 48170
734-455-1722
734-455-0222

Grant Gardner, VP Sales

Federal Fluid Power
1145 Starkweather

up to 30 Days
$100 Min

Tabulation of Bids Opened and Read on Thursday, December 
1, 2011 for Aggregate Spreader Parts: 
IFB No. 8344-OQ

Bid typed on Thursday, December 1, 2011

573-262-3545
573-262-3540

DeWayne Stroder, Parts Manager

3 - 5 Days

Vendor 1

Viking Cives Midwest
PO Box 295
Morley, MO 63767

VENDOR NAME
ADDRESS

PHONE NUMBER
FAX NUMBER

DELIVERY:
Minimum Order Requirements

SIGNED

Penalty for less than minimum order

*Used throughout document to indicate a part/number/description/quantity was changed by Vendor. Please refer to Vendor's bid form for actual change.
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IFB No. 8344



ROAD COMMISSION FOR OAKLAND COUNTY - Beverly Hills, Michigan

RCOC
STOCK NO. DESCRIPTION 1 QTY UofM

4400024
GREASABLE FLANGE BEARING
SB206-20 JZ LF206
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 7 EA

4400107
1" AUGER BEARING
SB205 16G/FL 2 BOLT FLANGE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4400404 SPINNER HUB
SWENSON 0601200100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 15 EA

4401022 AUGER WELDMENT
SWENSON 0010696200
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4401056 INSERT(SWENSON TAILGATE SPRDR)
SWENSON 0010632100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4403036

PROPORTIONAL SOLENOID
REXROTH HYDRAULICS 578537
FT WE2 KC30/100AG12C2V
(BY-PASS REQUIRED) NO 
SUBSTITUTION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 30 EA

4403044 
CABLE ASSEMBLY
COMPUSPREAD 107564
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4404000
HYDRAULIC AUGER MOTOR 6 CU IN
W/4 PIN CONNECT WHITE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

4404068
SPINNER MOTOR 3 CU IN
SWENSON 1011001009
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 35 EA

4405016
D.A. ELECTRIC SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC118887
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4405024
SPINNER SECTION
REXROTH 1602052906 26D422
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA

4405032
AUGER SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC016563
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4405040 UNLOADER INLET BASIC 190156
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 2 EA

4406006

SPINNER DISC POLYURETHANE
SWENSON 04622 002 00
17-3/4 DIAMETER - COUNTER 
CLOCKWISE
ROTATION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

93489
M5966 AUGER, 1 WAY, DD GEARBOX
MONROE 00021636
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

93491

M5966 AUGER BUSHING 
UHMWMONROE 04041325
2-15/32" O.D x 1-9/32" I.D. x 4"
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA

93508
CLAMP STYLE 50 PULSE SENSOR
FORCE AMERICA 200018097
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA

93717
GEAR BOX SANDER
SUPERIOR F0065 MONROE05007338
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA

94038
MOTOR HYD 3.0 CU IN
VIKING CIVES 0550278
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

94039
SPINNER DISC PLY 22" STRT FLTS
VIKING CIVES 0710038
BRAND NAME / NUMBER5 5 EA

Tabulation of Bids Opened and Read on Thursday, December 
1, 2011 for Aggregate Spreader Parts: 
IFB No. 8344-OQ

Bid typed on Thursday, December 1, 2011

VENDOR NAME
ADDRESS

PHONE NUMBER
FAX NUMBER

DELIVERY:
Minimum Order Requirements

SIGNED

Penalty for less than minimum order

BRAND NAME UNIT EXTENDED BRAND NAME UNIT
& NUMBER PRICE AMOUNT & NUMBER PRICE

LSSB206-20 14.77$                  103.39$                
 Swenson

SW090408000500 46.50$                  

NO BID NO BID NO BID
 Swenson

SW090408001100 41.10                    

NO BID NO BID NO BID
 Buyers

924F0017A 35.00                    

NO BID NO BID NO BID
 Swenson

0010696200 438.01                  

NO BID NO BID NO BID
 Swenson

00106 321 00 22.71                    

NO BID NO BID NO BID Bosch 20276 205.00                  

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bosch 107365
(replaced 
#107564) 423.00                  

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

LS101100 232.10                  8,123.50               NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID
 Bosch
118887 1,216.00               

NO BID NO BID NO BID
 Bosch
115083 1,216.00               

NO BID NO BID NO BID
 Bosch
016563 1,398.00               

NO BID NO BID NO BID
 Bosch
190156 1,014.00               

LSSP18CCW 62.69                    626.90                  
 Buyers
9240016 98.00                    

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

LS710038 98.21                    491.05                  NO BID NO BID
TOTAL: 9,344.84$            TOTAL:

Vendor Total: 9,344.84$            Vendor Total:

Vendor 3

Lacal Equipment Inc.
901 West Pike Street
Jackson Center, OH 45334
800-543-6161
937-596-5433

Roger W. Detrick, President

3-4 Days
$50.00

Freight will be added

Vendor 4

Shults Equipment Inc.
1532 S State Road
Ithaca, MI 48847
800-292-9297
989-875-2922

Mark Hoard, President

7-30 Days
None
* We will hold prices firm for as long

hold them firm to us

*Used throughout document to indicate a part/number/description/quantity was changed by Vendor. Please refer to Vendor's bid form for actual change.
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IFB No. 8344



ROAD COMMISSION FOR OAKLAND COUNTY - Beverly Hills, Michigan

RCOC
STOCK NO. DESCRIPTION 1 QTY UofM

4400024
GREASABLE FLANGE BEARING
SB206-20 JZ LF206
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 7 EA

4400107
1" AUGER BEARING
SB205 16G/FL 2 BOLT FLANGE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4400404 SPINNER HUB
SWENSON 0601200100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 15 EA

4401022 AUGER WELDMENT
SWENSON 0010696200
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4401056 INSERT(SWENSON TAILGATE SPRDR)
SWENSON 0010632100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4403036

PROPORTIONAL SOLENOID
REXROTH HYDRAULICS 578537
FT WE2 KC30/100AG12C2V
(BY-PASS REQUIRED) NO 
SUBSTITUTION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 30 EA

4403044 
CABLE ASSEMBLY
COMPUSPREAD 107564
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4404000
HYDRAULIC AUGER MOTOR 6 CU IN
W/4 PIN CONNECT WHITE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

4404068
SPINNER MOTOR 3 CU IN
SWENSON 1011001009
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 35 EA

4405016
D.A. ELECTRIC SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC118887
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4405024
SPINNER SECTION
REXROTH 1602052906 26D422
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA

4405032
AUGER SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC016563
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4405040 UNLOADER INLET BASIC 190156
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 2 EA

4406006

SPINNER DISC POLYURETHANE
SWENSON 04622 002 00
17-3/4 DIAMETER - COUNTER 
CLOCKWISE
ROTATION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

93489
M5966 AUGER, 1 WAY, DD GEARBOX
MONROE 00021636
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

93491

M5966 AUGER BUSHING 
UHMWMONROE 04041325
2-15/32" O.D x 1-9/32" I.D. x 4"
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA

93508
CLAMP STYLE 50 PULSE SENSOR
FORCE AMERICA 200018097
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA

93717
GEAR BOX SANDER
SUPERIOR F0065 MONROE05007338
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA

94038
MOTOR HYD 3.0 CU IN
VIKING CIVES 0550278
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

94039
SPINNER DISC PLY 22" STRT FLTS
VIKING CIVES 0710038
BRAND NAME / NUMBER5 5 EA

Tabulation of Bids Opened and Read on Thursday, December 
1, 2011 for Aggregate Spreader Parts: 
IFB No. 8344-OQ

Bid typed on Thursday, December 1, 2011

VENDOR NAME
ADDRESS

PHONE NUMBER
FAX NUMBER

DELIVERY:
Minimum Order Requirements

SIGNED

Penalty for less than minimum order

EXTENDED
AMOUNT

325.50$                

205.50                  

525.00                  

2,190.05               

113.55                  

6,150.00               

2,115.00               

NO BID

NO BID

6,080.00               

3,648.00               

6,990.00               

2,028.00               

980.00                  

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
31,350.60$          

31,350.60$          

g as our suppliers 
s.

*Used throughout document to indicate a part/number/description/quantity was changed by Vendor. Please refer to Vendor's bid form for actual change.
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IFB No. 8344



ROAD COMMISSION FOR OAKLAND COUNTY - Beverly Hills, Michigan

RCOC
STOCK NO. DESCRIPTION 1 QTY UofM

4400024
GREASABLE FLANGE BEARING
SB206-20 JZ LF206
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 7 EA

4400107
1" AUGER BEARING
SB205 16G/FL 2 BOLT FLANGE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4400404 SPINNER HUB
SWENSON 0601200100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 15 EA

4401022 AUGER WELDMENT
SWENSON 0010696200
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4401056 INSERT(SWENSON TAILGATE SPRDR)
SWENSON 0010632100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4403036

PROPORTIONAL SOLENOID
REXROTH HYDRAULICS 578537
FT WE2 KC30/100AG12C2V
(BY-PASS REQUIRED) NO 
SUBSTITUTION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 30 EA

4403044 
CABLE ASSEMBLY
COMPUSPREAD 107564
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4404000
HYDRAULIC AUGER MOTOR 6 CU IN
W/4 PIN CONNECT WHITE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

4404068
SPINNER MOTOR 3 CU IN
SWENSON 1011001009
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 35 EA

4405016
D.A. ELECTRIC SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC118887
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4405024
SPINNER SECTION
REXROTH 1602052906 26D422
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA

4405032
AUGER SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC016563
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4405040 UNLOADER INLET BASIC 190156
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 2 EA

4406006

SPINNER DISC POLYURETHANE
SWENSON 04622 002 00
17-3/4 DIAMETER - COUNTER 
CLOCKWISE
ROTATION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

93489
M5966 AUGER, 1 WAY, DD GEARBOX
MONROE 00021636
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

93491

M5966 AUGER BUSHING 
UHMWMONROE 04041325
2-15/32" O.D x 1-9/32" I.D. x 4"
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA

93508
CLAMP STYLE 50 PULSE SENSOR
FORCE AMERICA 200018097
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA

93717
GEAR BOX SANDER
SUPERIOR F0065 MONROE05007338
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA

94038
MOTOR HYD 3.0 CU IN
VIKING CIVES 0550278
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

94039
SPINNER DISC PLY 22" STRT FLTS
VIKING CIVES 0710038
BRAND NAME / NUMBER5 5 EA

Tabulation of Bids Opened and Read on Thursday, December 
1, 2011 for Aggregate Spreader Parts: 
IFB No. 8344-OQ

Bid typed on Thursday, December 1, 2011

VENDOR NAME
ADDRESS

PHONE NUMBER
FAX NUMBER

DELIVERY:
Minimum Order Requirements

SIGNED

Penalty for less than minimum order

BRAND NAME UNIT EXTENDED BRAND NAME UNIT
& NUMBER PRICE AMOUNT & NUMBER PRICE

Monroe 05030024 16.07$                  112.49$                16.07$                  

Monroe 05030023 12.54                    62.70                    12.54                    

Monroe 05051380 24.09                    361.35                  24.09                    

Monroe 00021636 310.78                  1,553.90               310.78                  

Monroe 00035990 32.63                    163.15                  32.63                    

 Rexroth
201688 & 250339 173.48                  5,204.40               173.48                  

 Rexroth 107365 360.32                  1,801.60               360.32                  

Monroe 05006628 623.45                  6,234.50               623.45                  

Monroe 05006546 163.58                  5,725.30               163.58                  

 Rexroth 118887 931.27                  4,656.35               1,075.78               

 Rexroth 115083 1,026.44               3,079.32               1,026.44               

 Rexroth 016563 1,016.56               5,082.80               1,184.32               

 Rexroth 190156 740.08                  1,480.16               861.76                  

 Monroe 
05050071-B 82.54                    825.40                  82.54                    

Monroe 00021636 310.78                  1,553.90               310.78                  

Monroe 05051325 14.87                    118.96                  14.87                    

Force 200018097 166.37                  499.11                  166.37                  

Monroe 05007338 319.50                  2,556.00               319.50                  

 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
TOTAL: 41,071.39$          TOTAL:

Vendor Total: 41,071.39$          Vendor Total:

3-5 Days
NoneNone

Vendor 6

Truck & Trailer Specialties, Inc 
6726 Hanna Lake Ave
Dutton, MI 49316
616-698-8215
616-698-0972

Dan Bouwman, President

Vendor 5
Truck & Trailer Specialties, Inc - 
ALTERNATE Bid #1
6726 Hanna Lake Ave
Dutton, MI 49316

3-5 Days

616-698-8215
616-698-0972

Dan Bouwman, President

*Used throughout document to indicate a part/number/description/quantity was changed by Vendor. Please refer to Vendor's bid form for actual change.
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IFB No. 8344



ROAD COMMISSION FOR OAKLAND COUNTY - Beverly Hills, Michigan

RCOC
STOCK NO. DESCRIPTION 1 QTY UofM

4400024
GREASABLE FLANGE BEARING
SB206-20 JZ LF206
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 7 EA

4400107
1" AUGER BEARING
SB205 16G/FL 2 BOLT FLANGE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4400404 SPINNER HUB
SWENSON 0601200100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 15 EA

4401022 AUGER WELDMENT
SWENSON 0010696200
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4401056 INSERT(SWENSON TAILGATE SPRDR)
SWENSON 0010632100
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4403036

PROPORTIONAL SOLENOID
REXROTH HYDRAULICS 578537
FT WE2 KC30/100AG12C2V
(BY-PASS REQUIRED) NO 
SUBSTITUTION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 30 EA

4403044 
CABLE ASSEMBLY
COMPUSPREAD 107564
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4404000
HYDRAULIC AUGER MOTOR 6 CU IN
W/4 PIN CONNECT WHITE
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

4404068
SPINNER MOTOR 3 CU IN
SWENSON 1011001009
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 35 EA

4405016
D.A. ELECTRIC SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC118887
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4405024
SPINNER SECTION
REXROTH 1602052906 26D422
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA

4405032
AUGER SECTION
COMPUSPREAD HC016563
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

4405040 UNLOADER INLET BASIC 190156
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 2 EA

4406006

SPINNER DISC POLYURETHANE
SWENSON 04622 002 00
17-3/4 DIAMETER - COUNTER 
CLOCKWISE
ROTATION
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

93489
M5966 AUGER, 1 WAY, DD GEARBOX
MONROE 00021636
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 5 EA

93491

M5966 AUGER BUSHING 
UHMWMONROE 04041325
2-15/32" O.D x 1-9/32" I.D. x 4"
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA

93508
CLAMP STYLE 50 PULSE SENSOR
FORCE AMERICA 200018097
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 3 EA

93717
GEAR BOX SANDER
SUPERIOR F0065 MONROE05007338
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 8 EA

94038
MOTOR HYD 3.0 CU IN
VIKING CIVES 0550278
BRAND NAME / NUMBER 10 EA

94039
SPINNER DISC PLY 22" STRT FLTS
VIKING CIVES 0710038
BRAND NAME / NUMBER5 5 EA

Tabulation of Bids Opened and Read on Thursday, December 
1, 2011 for Aggregate Spreader Parts: 
IFB No. 8344-OQ

Bid typed on Thursday, December 1, 2011

VENDOR NAME
ADDRESS

PHONE NUMBER
FAX NUMBER

DELIVERY:
Minimum Order Requirements

SIGNED

Penalty for less than minimum order

NO BIDDER

St. Regis Culvert, Inc.
202 Morrell Street
Charlotte, MI 48813

Chris Mooney, Sales Manager

EXTENDED
AMOUNT

112.49$                

62.70                    

361.35                  

1,553.90               

163.15                  

5,204.40               

1,801.60               

6,234.50               

5,725.30               

5,378.90               

3,079.32               

5,921.60               

1,723.52               

825.40                  

1,553.90               

118.96                  

499.11                  

2,556.00               

NO BID

NO BID
42,876.10$          

42,876.10$          

*Used throughout document to indicate a part/number/description/quantity was changed by Vendor. Please refer to Vendor's bid form for actual change.
8344_Aggregate Spreader Parts_12.01.11

IFB No. 8344


