ROAD COMMISSION FOR OAKLAND COUNTY - Beverly Hills, Michigan
Tabulation of Bids Opened and Read on Tuesday, November 15, 2011 for Cold Patch - High

Performance; IFB No. 8317-0Q
Bid typed on Wednesday, November 16, 2011

Vendor 1

Vendor 2

Ven

VENDOR NAME
ADDRESS

PHONE NUMBER

Surface Coatings Company

2280 Auburn Road

Auburn Hills, M| 48326

248-338-0335

Ajax Materials Corporation

830 Kirts Blvd, Suite #100

Troy, MI 48084
248-244-3355

Barrett Paving Mat

5800 Cherry Hill Ro
Ypsilanti, Ml 48198
734-483-4775

FAX NUMBER 248-338-8443 248-244-0800 734-483-4774
SIGNED Lee F. Lowis, Vice President Brian Borich, Sales Manager Michael S. Fraker, ¢
TERMS
FOB
DELIVERY: 2 Days 24-48 Hours 1-2 Days (50 Ton M
RCOC UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT
STOCK NO. DESCRIPTION 1 LOCATION QTY | UofM PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE
3100104 COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE MILFORD - DELIVERED 100 Ton NO BID NO BID $ %x93.75 | $ % 9,375.00 | $ 103.35
3100104 COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE DAVISBURG - DELIVERED 100 Ton NO BID NO BID 94.55 9,455.00 102.35
3100104 COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE LAKE ORION - DELIVERED 100 Ton NO BID NO BID 93.55 9,355.00 101.35
3100104 COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE WATERFORD - DELIVERED 350 Ton NO BID NO BID 93.28 32,648.00 101.25
3100104 COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE SOUTHFIELD - DELIVERED 250 Ton NO BID NO BID 94,55 23,637.50 101.25
3100104 COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE TROY - DELIVERED 250 Ton NO BID NO BID 93.28 23,320.00 101.00
PALLET COLD PATCH MILFORD - DELIVERED 6 PL 691.04 4,146.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH DAVISBURG - DELIVERED 3 PL 691.04 2,073.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH LAKE ORION - DELIVERED 3 PL 691.04 2,073.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH WATERFORD - DELIVERED 8 PL 691.04 5,528.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH SOUTHFIELD - DELIVERED 7 PL 691.04 4,837.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH TROY - DELIVERED 8 PL 691.04 5,528.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL:]| $ 24,186.40 TOTAL:| $ 107,790.50 TOTAL.:
Vendor Total:| $ 24,186.40 Vendor Total:| $ 107,790.50 Vendor Total:
Brand of bagged product: JUPM High Performance Cold Patch N/A N/A - No Bid
Number of bags per pallet]56 N/A N/A
Weight per bag]50 Ibs. N/A N/A

*Used throughout document to indicate a part/number/description/quantity was changed by Vendor. Please refer to Vendor's bid form for actual change.

* Note: During Frost Law Restrictions,
there will be an additional charge of
$7.00 per ton for deliveries during the
time the Road Commission or MDOT
requirements for weight restrictions are

in effect.
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ROAD COMMISSION FOR OAKLAND COUNTY - Beverly Hills, Michigan

Tabulation of Bids Opened and Read on Tuesday, November 15, 2011 for Cold Patch - High
Performance; IFB No. 8317-0Q

Bid typed on Wednesday, November 16, 2011

idor 3
VENDOR NAME terials
ADDRESS ad

PHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER
SIGNED Bales Manager
TERMS
FOB
DELIVERY: in.)
RCOC EXTENDED
STOCK NO. DESCRIPTION 1 LOCATION QTY | UofM AMOUNT
3100104 [COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE MILFORD - DELIVERED 100 | Ton |$ 10,335.00
3100104 |COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE DAVISBURG - DELIVERED 100 | Ton 10,235.00
3100104 [COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE LAKE ORION - DELIVERED 100 | Ton 10,135.00
3100104 |COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE WATERFORD - DELIVERED 350 [ Ton 35,437.50
3100104 [COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE SOUTHFIELD - DELIVERED 250 | Ton 25,312.50
3100104 |COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE TROY - DELIVERED 250 | Ton 25,250.00
PALLET COLD PATCH MILFORD - DELIVERED 6 PL NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH DAVISBURG - DELIVERED 3 PL NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH LAKE ORION - DELIVERED 3 PL NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH WATERFORD - DELIVERED 8 PL NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH SOUTHFIELD - DELIVERED 7 PL NO BID
PALLET COLD PATCH TROY - DELIVERED 8 PL NO BID
$ 116,705.00
$ 116,705.00

Brand of bagged product:

Number of bags per pallet
Weight per bag

*Used throughout document to indicate a part/number/description/quantity was changed by Vendor. Please refer to Vendor's bid form for actual change.
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ROAD COMMISSION FOR OAKLAND COUNTY - Beverly Hills, Michigan
Tabulation of Bids Opened and Read on Tuesday, November 15, 2011 for Cold Patch - High
Performance; IFB No. 8317-0Q
Bid typed on Wednesday, November 16, 2011
Vendor 4 Vendor 5 NO BIDDER
VENDOR NAME Saginaw Asphalt Paving Co. Cadillac Asphalt NONE
ADDRESS 2981 Carrollton Road 2575 Haggerty Road
Saginaw, MI 48604 Canton, Ml 48188
PHONE NUMBER 989-755-8147 248-380-3644
FAX NUMBER 989-755-0426 734-449-8488
SIGNED Nathan Gotts, Project Manager Dennis West, Sales Manager
TERMS
FOB
DELIVERY: 2 Days 3 Days
RCOC UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
STOCK NO. DESCRIPTION 1 LOCATION QTY | UofM PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
3100104 [COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE MILFORD - DELIVERED 100 | Ton |$ 79.00 | $ 7,900.00 | $ 88.87 | $ 8,887.00
3100104 [COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE DAVISBURG - DELIVERED 100 | Ton 79.00 7,900.00 89.54 8,954.00
3100104 [COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE LAKE ORION - DELIVERED 100 | Ton 79.00 7,900.00 89.27 8,927.00
3100104 [COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE WATERFORD - DELIVERED 350 | Ton 78.50 27,475.00 88.52 30,982.00
3100104 [COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE SOUTHFIELD - DELIVERED 250 | Ton 80.00 20,000.00 87.64 21,910.00
3100104 [COLD PATCH -HIGH PERFORMANCE TROY - DELIVERED 250 | Ton 80.00 20,000.00 87.90 21,975.00
PALLET COLD PATCH MILFORD - DELIVERED 6 PL 1,000.00 6,000.00 1,100.00 6,600.00
PALLET COLD PATCH DAVISBURG - DELIVERED 3 PL 1,000.00 3,000.00 1,100.00 3,300.00
PALLET COLD PATCH LAKE ORION - DELIVERED 3 PL 1,000.00 3,000.00 1,100.00 3,300.00
PALLET COLD PATCH WATERFORD - DELIVERED 8 PL 1,000.00 8,000.00 1,100.00 8,800.00
PALLET COLD PATCH SOUTHFIELD - DELIVERED 7 PL 1,000.00 7,000.00 1,100.00 7,700.00
PALLET COLD PATCH TROY - DELIVERED 8 PL 1,000.00 8,000.00 1,100.00 8,800.00
TOTAL:| $ 126,175.00 TOTAL:| $ 140,135.00
Vendor Total:] $ 126,175.00 Vendor Total:] $ 140,135.00
Brand of bagged product:JQPR High Performance Quikrete
Number of bags per pallet]63 63
Weight per bag]50 Ibs. 50 Ibs.
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*Used throughout document to indicate a part/number/description/quantity was changed by Vendor. Please refer to Vendor's bid form for actual change. IFB No. 8317



